
 
 

WELLNESS TEAM 
MINUTES 3/3/11 

 
Present:  Dan McFadden, Angie Maddy, Diane Engle, Rita Thurber, Kathy Brock, Carol Dellinger 
 
The team made tweaks to the Wellness Team website posting that is proposed.  Carol will make the 
changes indicated and see about getting this site up.   
   
Concern was voiced over a student who is acting oddly and talking to himself.  He is thought to be an 
automotive student and also has a class with Mr. Johnson.   The student is not perceived as dangerous, 
but odd enough that he is noticed. 
 
Concern was expressed for Caleb Frazier, whose brother was killed due to a drug overdose.  This is the 
second brother he has lost this way.  Caleb is Cody Crowell’s roommate.  Carol heard from Caleb and he 
said he was doing okay, just trying to keep busy and focused on school.  She will follow up some more. 
 
Stacy Bittel requested to let her boyfriend stay over the weekend.  The request was granted, then 
rescinded when Dan found out that he had been in her room overnight during the week.  Dan has 
banned him from the dorms and fined Stacey $250.  He thought she seemed almost relieved.  Concern 
was voiced when Ken Henderson had indicated that the hand injury Stacy claimed to have gotten as an 
athletic trainer did not fit the accident she described.  Kathy Brock concurs with this assessment.  There 
is concern that Stacy is in a domestic violence situation and does not know how to get away.  Carol will 
make up some packets of information about domestic violence/dating violence and give them to Ken 
and Kathy to share with Stacy. 
 
 Rod Killian has dropped two of his four classes.  Rita noted that he plans to drop Voc Rehab because he 
says they are not helping him, and that he cannot handle a full load of classes, which is what they 
expect.   
 
A male friend of Sarah Schmidt’s reported to security that she had been talking about killing herself.  
Carol attempted to visit her, but could not find her at home.  Dan said that she reported to him and to 
security that she had just had a bad day and was mouthing off.  He said that she is basically a level-
headed young lady and that he didn’t have particular concern.   
 
Tara Barry is not attending class at all.  Carol attempted to go see her, but she was not at home.  Dan 
said she hadn’t been around the dorms for a couple of days.  He was concerned because she had 
expressed an interest in Aaron Shipley, a former student with a criminal history.  Carol will continue to 
try to see Tara. 
 
Submitted by Carol Dellinger 


